
Sale number Municipality Parcel Owner Property Description Upset Price Results
25-0009 BOROUGH OF ALBURTIS 01-546374239647-0000001 ANDREWS CRAIG R & FAITH C 600 FRANKLIN ST 120,126.76$ no bid
25-0276 BOROUGH OF CATASAUQUA 04-640809028565-0000001 POPHALY MUKESH & MEETA 129-133 BRIDGE ST 70,006.28$   sold bidder #485; $205,000
25-0277 BOROUGH OF CATASAUQUA 04-640809123001-0000001 POPHALY MUKESH & MEETA 2ND ST 20,903.81$   sold bidder #485; $33,000
25-0287 BOROUGH OF CATASAUQUA 04-640847584450-0000001 ROTHROCK DALE A 705 FAITH DR 32,751.21$   sold bidder #112; $182,000
25-0470 BOROUGH OF SLATINGTON 18-556232741837-0000001 BOYLAN KEVIN 224 RAILROAD ST 11,315.98$   sold bidder#458; $83,000
25-0079 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-549783356884-0000001 720 FOUNTAIN LLC 720 N FOUNTAIN ST 31,014.66$   no bid
25-0081 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-549783365089-0000001 ALSAED WAJIHA & KHALED ALSAED 724 N FOUNTAIN ST 44,790.04$   no bid
25-0036 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-549688285300-0000001 BROWN JAMES M 1219.5 W WALNUT ST 38,856.81$   sold bidder #196; $140,000
25-0098 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-549793037814-0000001 BROWN JENNIE LEE E 625 N LUMBER ST 15,297.83$   sold bidder #319; $76,000
25-0030 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-549678356587-0000001 ERDMAN RICHARD W JR 35 S 14TH ST 9,813.65$     sold bidder #455; $150,000
25-0132 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-640646385556-0000001 ES MELHEM LLC 926-932 S 4TH ST 13,415.34$   no bid
25-0045 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-549699608301-0000001 KELLY DORIS H & KATHLEEN A KELLY 119 S 10TH ST 44,300.53$   sold bidder #196; minimum bid
25-0097 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-549792940600-0000001 MOHAMDEIN JAMES O 414 N HALL ST 9,413.64$     sold bidder #399; $71,000
25-0224 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-640771296447-0000001 PANIAGUA EMMA 207 E UNION ST 12,364.64$   sold bidder #458; $95,000
25-0218 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-640745502508-0000001 SNYDER PAUL E & DOROTHY M 536 N BRICK ST 9,797.51$     sold bidder #312; $93,000
25-0123 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-640628915761-0000001 VANDLING TERRY JR 501-537 AUBURN ST 43,631.70$   sold bidder #458; minimum bid
25-0071 CITY OF ALLENTOWN 02-549781857148-0000001 VON LORDE XAVIER 948 W PINE ST 12,709.66$   sold bidder #186; $41,000
25-0258 CITY OF BETHLEHEM 03-641796323417-0000001 GREEN THELMA L 1619 BUDD AVE 28,982.17$   sold bidder #190; $154,000
25-0340 HEIDELBERG TOWNSHIP 10-554004006797-0000041 MOWREY MICHAEL & SUSAN 5728 PFEIFFER CIR 3,080.85$     sold bidder #396; $11,000
25-0348 LOWER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP 12-547307298637-0000001 3P HOLDINGS ALBURTIS RD 2,715.95$     no bid
25-0361 LOWER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP 12-547543489928-0000017 ASTON JASON & ERMA 998 S KROCKS RD 2,085.88$     no bid
25-0359 LOWER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP 12-547534573965-0000061 THOMAS THOMAS K 1190 GRANGE RD 8,938.88$     sold bidder #257; $18,500
25-0408 NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP16-547974370551-0000001 BULT KEITH S & SANDRA R BULT 2706 LEVANS RD 21,429.75$   sold bidder #112; $152,000
25-0388 NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP16-546886398028-0000051 KOCH CHAD 3619 LIL WOLF CIR 13,852.13$   sold bidder #196; minimum bid
25-0396 NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP16-546886398028-0000283 PERALTA JOSE 4237 PANTHER CT 33,216.65$   no bid
25-0395 NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP16-546886398028-0000268 RAMICH RUSSELL & SUSAN CAPRON 3635 LIL WOLF CIR 3,422.32$     sold bidde #196; minimum bid
25-0429 NORTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP16-558135836229-0000177 WATERS MATTHEW R 1054 DOGWOOD ST 4,364.68$     sold bidder #171; $24,000
25-0455 SALISBURY TOWNSHIP 17-641647903470-0000001 ALMGREN WILLIAM R & SANDRA L 1454 LEHIGH AVE 3,537.88$     no bid
25-0456 SALISBURY TOWNSHIP 17-641647905466-0000001 ALMGREN WILLIAM R & SANDRA L 1456 LEHIGH AVE 11,161.49$   no bid
25-0458 SALISBURY TOWNSHIP 17-641687750984-0000005 MENDEZ MAGALI 1617 SEIDERSVILLE RD 1,438.80$     sold bidder #196; $5,500
25-0447 SALISBURY TOWNSHIP 17-641645325037-0000001 SCHADT JOSEPH R 1316 E EMMAUS AVE 144,603.99$ no bid
25-0445 SALISBURY TOWNSHIP 17-641637856172-0000001 TROOP CAMP ASSOCIATION 1353 E SUSQUEHANNA ST 17,390.85$   no bid
25-0480 SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 19-548702782793-0000001 CLAUSER KENNETH A & ALMA E 1421 SPRINGHOUSE RD 35,121.28$   sold bidder #248; $255,000
25-0478 SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 19-548658790242-0000001 ELYSIUM ACQUISITIONS LLC 752 N 31ST ST 4,693.88$     sold bidder #302: minimum bid
25-0479 SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 19-548668092866-0000001 ELYSIUM ACQUISITIONS LLC 738 N MARSHALL ST 5,000.45$     sold bidder #302: minimum bid
25-0487 SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 19-549704005038-0000001 HANEY GLENN R 2140 W FAIRMONT ST 12,559.82$   sold bidder #248; $245,000
25-0489 SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 19-549714990328-0000001 J & J 410 LLC ROTH AVE 5,723.54$     sold bidder #301; minimum bid
25-0490 SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 19-549715909118-0000001 J & J 410 LLC 1312-1314 N 18TH ST 10,799.56$   sold bidder #280; minimum bid
25-0491 SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 19-549724092334-0000001 J & J 410 LLC 1302-1306 N 18TH ST 27,815.08$   no bid
25-0475 SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 19-548604572684-0000001 KLINE LILLIAN 353 TAMARACK DR 30,364.46$   sold bidder #196; $190,000
25-0476 SOUTH WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 19-548633217185-0000001 MILLER DOUGLAS A 26-28 S 38TH ST 10,997.48$   sold bidder #455; $108,000
25-0504 UPPER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP 20-545468533800-0000150 BUSKIRK ALAN 8753 TURKEY RIDGE RD 1,066.32$     sold bidder #71; $5,000
25-0527 UPPER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP 20-545468533800-0000725 CHAVOLLA LUIS & ELIA RAMIREZ 8772 BREINIG RUN CIR 3,833.40$     sold bidder #196; minimum bid
25-0493 UPPER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP 20-544486174418-0000048 GIUDICE ERNEST 10202 CAMP GROVE LN 9,926.67$     sold bidder #396; minimum bid
25-0516 UPPER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP 20-545468533800-0000399 HAWKS BONNIE & PATRIC 8911 BREINIG RUN CIR 11,970.12$   no bid
25-0514 UPPER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP 20-545468533800-0000350 JIMENEZ KEISHLA ALERS 8844 BREINIG RUN CIR 4,062.22$     sold bidder #71; $6,000
25-0537 UPPER MACUNGIE TOWNSHIP 20-546665537633-0000001 OLDT SANDRA S & KEVIN W OLDT 6301 W TILGHMAN ST 834.94$        no bid
25-0586 UPPER SAUCON TOWNSHIP 22-642444948812-0000001 BETZ JOHN F JR & RHONDA 3520 STATION AVE 36,137.14$   sold bidder #166; $260,000
25-0589 UPPER SAUCON TOWNSHIP 22-643418120249-0000001 BISSELL THERESA 2253 TAYLOR DR 29,571.29$   no bid
25-0578 UPPER SAUCON TOWNSHIP 22-641477777876-0000008 DIETZ JOEL & TARA 4942 PA ROUTE 309 6,853.16$     no bid
25-0575 UPPER SAUCON TOWNSHIP 22-641477632291-0000044 KUNSMAN RUTH 5002 PA ROUTE 309 4,839.66$     sold bidder #257; $7,000
25-0573 UPPER SAUCON TOWNSHIP 22-641477632291-0000034 PILCH BRIAN D 5002 PA ROUTE 309 1,853.01$     sold bidder #196; minimum bid
25-0623 WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP 23-556114344003-0000001 GILDNER CAROL & JASMINE GILDNER LEAH DR 13,265.27$   sold bidder #106; $14,500
25-0599 WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP 23-554280073263-0000001 MOATS RANDALL K & KATHLEEN A 4032 MAIN ST 30,490.59$   no bid
25-0608 WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP 23-555220023152-0000001 RAUCH RUSSELL B ESTATE 3671 MAIN ST 15,424.73$   sold bidder #315; minimum bid



25-0596 WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP 23-554273765525-0000001 SMITH CAROL L 8539 BROWN ST 5,809.71$     sold bidder #71; minimum bid
25-0597 WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP 23-554273850903-0000001 SMITH EVA ESTATE 8535 BROWN ST 14,710.13$   no bid
25-0601 WASHINGTON TOWNSHIP 23-555056293063-0000001 SOFRANKO DOUGLAS D & CANDICE S REGA4327 CIDER PRESS RD 2,052.82$     no bid
25-0629 WEISENBERG TOWNSHIP 24-543890105481-0000001 ALSTON TARANCE 7709 SHADY CT 7,827.18$     sold bidder #459; minimum bid
25-0649 WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 25-549882348155-0000001 H & L HOLDINGS LLC JEFFERSON ST 82,899.53$   sold bidder #260; minimum bid
25-0650 WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 25-549882419004-0000001 KURLANSIK HENRY TRUST 1045 GRAPE ST 247,435.56$ sold bidder #301; $500,000
25-0658 WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 25-558084369606-0000001 MORIAH PIKIN HOLDING CO 5456 2ND ST 27,257.41$   no bid
25-0637 WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 25-548993615940-0000001 NIKAL LLC 3665 MACARTHUR RD 106,236.08$ no bid
25-0638 WHITEHALL TOWNSHIP 25-549767375577-0000001 RAVI VIJAY 351 HAWTHORN LN 33,907.28$   sold bidder#228; $118,000


